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EIZO	Earns	EPEAT	Silver	Certification	for	Reducing	Environmental	
Impact	

Hakusan,	Japan,	April	10,	2020	– EIZO Corporation (TSE: 6737) today announced that four of its 
FlexScan EV series monitors earned EPEAT Silver certification for reducing environmental impact.  

EPEAT (Electronic Product Environmental Assessment Tool) is an electronic product environmental 
assessment system which was established in the USA in 2006. Today, government facilities and 
thousands of private and public institutions refer to EPEAT for sustainable procurement. The EPEAT 
criteria were updated in 2018 to include stricter guidelines and add criteria concerning energy 
management, occupational health, and safety development throughout the entire supply chain. 
Products are ranked as EPEAT Gold, Silver, or Bronze depending on the extent to which they meet 
the criteria. 

The EIZO Group has endorsed and worked towards the EPEAT goals it since its implementation and 
the FlexScan EV series of monitors were among the first products to meet the Bronze rank in 
accordance with the 2018 updated policies. Now, four models have earned EPEAT Silver 
certification as testament to EIZO’s goals to lower environmental impact of its products and 
continue CSR activities. 

EIZO’s corporate philosophy is “Through the pursuit of imaging solutions with advanced 
technologies, we enrich people in their professional and personal lives.” In pursuit of this, EIZO aims 
to meet the higher standards set forth by EPEAT Gold to further reduce environmental impact of its 
products and business practices. 

Certified	Monitors	
FlexScan EV2460 
FlexScan EV2360 
FlexScan EV2760 
FlexScan EV2457 

About	EIZO	
EIZO (TSE:6737), which means image in Japanese, is a visual technology company that develops 
and manufactures high-end visual solutions to enrich people in their professional and personal 
lives. EIZO offers total imaging solutions with a range of monitors, software, video capture, 
processing, and distribution solutions, cameras, and advanced integrated technologies to meet the 
specialized needs of customers in business, creative fields, healthcare, air traffic control, maritime, 
security & surveillance, and more. Headquartered in Hakusan, Japan, EIZO has R&D and 
manufacturing facilities in Japan, China, Germany, and the United States, and representation in 
more than 90 countries.

EIZO,	the	EIZO	Logo,	and	FlexScan	are	registered	trademarks	of	EIZO	Corporation	in	Japan	and	other	countries.	
All	other	company	names,	product	names,	and	logos	are	trademarks	or	registered	trademarks	of	their	respective	
companies.	


